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proposal of the Russian Federation to make available Mr. G. 
Bessonov as the TER Project Manager as of 1 January 2004, 
which proposal has been already accepted by the UNECE. He 
summarized the results achieved by the Project as well as his 
own activities in the reporting period from the last meeting of the 
Committee. Speaking about the results of collaboration with the 
international organizations dealing with the rail transport, he 
mentioned inter alia the involvement of the TER in the SETA 
project, aimed at the improvement of connections between the 
north Adriatic seaports and landlocked countries of Central 
Europe as well as in the NEAR2 (Network of European-Asian Rail 
Research Capacities), the Trade Facilitation and Caucasus 
Transit Corridor (CTC) and the Southeast Europe Programme 
(SEE) projects. He also presented the outcomes of the two 
important TER meetings held in Sochi (Russian Federation) in 
May and in Bad Gastein (Austria), which were highly appreciated 
by the participants. 

7. Concluding his report, he extended his sincere thanks to all the 
TER National Coordinators for their support in the course of his 
assignment as the TER Project Manager and wished the new 
Project Manager all the best in performing his demanding tasks. 

8. The representative of the Russian Federation, Mr. S. Stolyarov as 
well as the UNECE representative, Mr. K. Alexopoulos expressed 
their high appreciation and gratitude to Mr. H. Meelich for his 
excellent performance as the TER Project Manager and for the 
achievements of the Project under his able managership. 

9. The Steering Committee endorsed the report of the Project 
Manager. 

 

 
STATUS OF TER TRUST FUND CONTRIBUTIONS FOR 2013 

 
10. The UNECE representatives reported on the status of the 2013 

TER Trust Fund contributions. As of 31 August 2013, 10 member 
countries transferred their 2013 payments to the Fund and the 
total unencumbered net Fund balance at the end of the year is 
thus expected to amount to USD 356.696. The Steering 
Committee asked the National Coordinators of the remaining 
countries to convey to the responsible authorities the request to 
settle the 2013 Trust Fund obligations as soon as possible, but by 
the end of the year at the latest. 

 
     TER COST PLAN FOR  2014 

 
11. The Project Manager introduced the proposal of the 2014 TER 

Cost Plan, amounting to net total of USD 229.000, underlining the 
fact that about half of these resources (USD 110.000) would be 
earmarked for the Group Training only. The Steering Committee 
took note of his proposal and stressed the need to adjust it in 
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